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14) Observed damage door gaskets at the sandwich deli-prep cooler causing a loss of sealant. Maintain equipment 
in good repair and fully operable. Repair within 90 days. 
 
14) Observed the finishes on the utensil shelve and table in the meat department chipping. Ensure surfaces of 
equipment are not a source of contamination and is finished as the be smooth, durable, cleanable, and 
nonabsorbent. Repair or correct within 90 days. 
 
14) Observed raw wood shelve in the bakery department. Ensure wood is finished to the nonporous, smooth, durable
, cleanable. Correct within 30 days.  
 
14) Observed the butcher block tables in bakery kitchen with a large crack and holes. Observed food buildup in the 
damaged areas. Resurface tables or replace within 90 days. 
 
14) Observed a plumbing leak at the deli department warewashing sink and waste bucket used to collect waste. 
Observed buildup of slimy mold on pipe. Maintain equipment in good repair. Clean and sanitize immediately. 
 
13) Observed 100ppm QAC sanitizer in sani-bucket at the deli department. Ensure disinfectant solution measures at 
200ppm QAC. Utilize test strips to test concentration every 2 hours or as needed. Correct ASAP.
 
13) Observed no QAC or Chlorine test strips at the facility. Obtain test strips immediately. 
 
17) 2ND NOTICE -Observed handwashing stations obstructed with objects at the meat, product, and deli 
department. Ensure all handwashing facilities are unobstructed and easily accessible for use at all times.
 
33) Observed numerous unshielded glass light bulbs at meat department area and display cases. Shield all glass 
light bulbs and or replace with shatter-resistant LED light bulbs. Correct within 60 days. 
 
14, 30) Observed build-up of dried blood and food in raw chicken display case and wall at deli department prep sink. 
Ensure areas subjected to raw meat storage and handling are cleaned and sanitized daily. Wash, clean, and sanitize 
ASAP.
 
29) Observed cracks and damaged floor vinyl and baseboards in the meat (behind grinder, in front of walk-in cooler, 
and customer service area), deli and bakery (in front of ovens) department. Maintain floors to be easily cleanable, 
smooth, durable, and non-absorbent. Ensure baseboards extend at least 4" at the junction of the floor and wall with a 
3/8" radius coved at the base. Repair or correct within 90 days.
 
20) Current food safety personal is no longer employed with the facility. Obtain a new food safety certificate within 60 
days and maintain a copy of cert onsite. 
 
 
NOTES:
1) Evidence were provided to show a severe active leak from the ceiling at the deli department prep and customer 
self-service beverage areas. Facility was advised by corporate to continue to operate during an active water leak. 
Facility is to be kept in good repair. Food to be sold and consumed are to be free from adulteration, safe, and 
protected from overhead contamination. In an event of an active ceiling leak in a food preparation, storage, or 
handling area, discontinue operation and contact the department immediately. FUTURE VIOLATION WILL RESULT 
IN FEES, ADMINISTRATIVE HEARING, AND/OR PERMIT SUSPENSION OR REVOCATION. 
2) Facility has removed pizza oven and installed 2 convection ovens with exhaust pipes in bakery department without 
pre-approval from the department. All new equipment must be pre-approved by the department prior to purchase and 
installation. 
3) Facility has plans for a remodel. Submit a plan check application for approval before construction. 
4)  A REINSPECTION FEE WILL BE ASSESSED TO REPEAT NON-COMPLIANCE. 
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